7040 2009-165 MAPO Salt

AGENCY
INVOICE ADDRESS

Independent Salt
Company
Price Per Ton

Tri-State
Commodities

Nebraska
Salt
No Bid

Cargill
No Bid

Morton Salt
No Bid

Adams County

Attn: Ellen Gomez

4955 E. 74™ Ave.
Commerce City CO 80022
Ellen Gomez 303-853-7103
Tim Sterkel (303)853-7136

$61.35

No Bid

City of Centennnial

13133 E Arapahoe Rd
Centennial, CO 80112
Tabitha Zokaitis (303)325.8023

$63.38

No Bid

City of Golden

Attn: Public Works

145 10™ St.

Golden CO 80401

Ron Reavis (303)384-8155

$62.38

$68.00

City of Aurora

Street Division

15740 E 32" Ave.

Aurora, CO 80011

Kim Quante (303)326-8200

$63.00

No Bid

City of Commerce City

Street Maintenance

Box 40

Commerce City, CO 80022
Sam Hoover 303-289-8153
Leonard Dietz (303)289-8147

$61.38

No Bid

City of Arvada

Street Division

6161 Wadsworth Blvd
Arvada CO 80003

Mark Bowman (720)898-7721

$61.29

No Bid
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City of Fort Collins

Street Department

625 9™ St.

PO Box 580

Fort Collins, CO 80522

Stan  Welsch (970)416-2091
(970)221-6615

$52.98 No Bid

City of Brighton

Attn: Procurement Ste 106

22 S. 4th Ave.

Brighton, CO 80601

Bob Younger

Sharon Williams (303)655-2088

$62.93 No Bid

City of Northglenn

12323 Claude Ct

Northglenn, CO 80233

Gene Maypole (303)450-4005

$62.44 $68.00

El Paso County DOT

3275 Akers Dr.

Colorado Springs, CO 80922
Leigh Simpson (719)520-7856

$73.23 $74.00

Jefferson County

21401 Golden Gate Canyon Rd.
Golden, CO 80403

Darren Moritz (303)271-5233

$62.49 No Bid

City of Thornton

9500 Civic Center Dr.
Thornton, CO. 80229

Marc Storm (720)977-6402

$61.54 No Bid
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City of Westminster

6575 W 88" Avenue
Westminster, Co. 80031
Pat Sexton (303)658.2521

$61.74

No Bid

City of Lakewood

850 Parfet Street

Lakewood, CO 80215

Ron Wagoner (303)987-7962

$61.90

No Bid

City of Colorado Springs Street Dept.

688 Geiger Ct.

Colorado Springs, Colorado 80915
Allen Peterson (719)385-6821 or
719-491-8688 cell

$71.47

$74.00
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